
  

 

05/03/2026 

                     NN-ICB/26-1500 

 

Dear Requestor  

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

 

Thank you for your request for information, received on 5 February 2026, regarding ADHD assessment 

services. We have processed your request in accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

(FOIA). 

Under the FOIA, public authorities like ours are required to respond to requests for information within 20 

working days. In response to your request, I can confirm that we partially hold the information requested.  

 

Please find below our response to your request: 

1. Do you currently have a commissioned adult ADHD assessment service? 

Yes. Further information can be found on the following website addresses:  

• Neurodevelopmental Referral Pathway for Adults | Nottinghamshire Healthcare NHS Foundation 

Trust 

• Home | Minds of All Kinds - Notts. 

2. How many adults do you have waiting for an adult ADHD assessment? 

3. What is your current expected waiting time (in weeks) for an adult ADHD Assessment? 

4. What is your current longest waiting time (in weeks) for an adult ADHD Assessment? 

For Questions 2, 3 and 4 above, the ICB does not hold this information. Accurate figures are currently 

unavailable due to a data cleansing exercise which is currently being undertaken. 

5. What is your process for reviewing and deciding whether to accept or reject adults who have been 

referred for an ADHD assessment? 

This information is publicly available and can be accessed here: Neurodevelopmental Referral 

Pathway for Adults | Nottinghamshire Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust. 

6. Is your organisation confident that it is satisfying the NICE guidelines for adults with ADHD? 

Services are commissioned to comply with NICE guidance. 

7. Do you currently have a commissioned child ADHD assessment service? 

Yes, details on our commissioned pathways can be found on Home | Minds of All Kinds - Notts. 

 

 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.nottinghamshirehealthcare.nhs.uk%2Fness-adults-pathway%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502055983%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=Fw1q8NZfU6ADQElAZ1rskJaEegPJf%2BIccS22B%2BlJJYo%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.nottinghamshirehealthcare.nhs.uk%2Fness-adults-pathway%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502055983%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=Fw1q8NZfU6ADQElAZ1rskJaEegPJf%2BIccS22B%2BlJJYo%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fmindsofallkindsnotts.co.uk%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502085133%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=Yv8CaNGWnQ1L0k8bGbcokGWIgy5ODBpq%2BsVfKg9DKKI%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.nottinghamshirehealthcare.nhs.uk%2Fness-adults-pathway%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502103568%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=jOfUpfN3LbyFhdLmgz9giOlkAG5V8uN6L%2FeiWGlf5xA%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.nottinghamshirehealthcare.nhs.uk%2Fness-adults-pathway%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502103568%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=jOfUpfN3LbyFhdLmgz9giOlkAG5V8uN6L%2FeiWGlf5xA%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fmindsofallkindsnotts.co.uk%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502122696%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=8LobmVRw%2FLOd5WbBXHHzosnBGcTPgE72YZWv%2F4iwdT8%3D&reserved=0


 

8. How many children do you have waiting for a child ADHD assessment? 

The ICB does not hold this information. You may wish to contact individual providers to request this 

and how to submit a Freedom of Information request to each provider can be found on their website 

links below: 

• Nottingham University Hospitals NHS Trust - https://www.nuh.nhs.uk/freedom-of-information  

• Sherwood Forest Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust - Freedom of Information | Sherwood Forest 

Hospitals 

• Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust - 

https://www.dbth.nhs.uk/contact/freedom-of-information/.  

9. What is your current expected waiting time (in weeks) for a child ADHD Assessment? 

The ICB does not hold this information as waiting time data is provided for the whole community 

paediatric service not just ADHD assessments.  

10. What is your current longest waiting time (in weeks) for a child ADHD Assessment? 

The ICB does not hold this information for Nottingham University Hospitals, Doncaster and Bassetlaw 

Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust and Sherwood Forest Hospitals. You may wish to contact 

individual providers to request this, details on how to contact them are provided in question 8. 

11. What is your process for reviewing and deciding whether to accept or reject children who have been 

referred for an ADHD assessment? 

The ICB does not hold this information. You may wish to contact individual providers to request this, 

details on how to contact them are provided in question 8.  

12. Is your organisation confident that it is satisfying the NICE guidelines for children with ADHD? 

The organisation commissions services in accordance with NICE guidance for children with ADHD. 

While these services are designed to meet clinical standards, current waiting times exceed the 

NICE-recommended 13-week timeframe. 

13. Has your organisation put any restrictions on Right to Choose services for diagnoses? 

No. 

a. If so, what restrictions have been put in place? 

Not applicable. 

b. If so, which companies, does it apply to? 

Not applicable. 

14. Has your organisation paused taking on new ADHD diagnoses at all? 

No. 

a. If so, why. 

Not applicable. 

 

If you are unhappy with the way in which your request has been handled, NHS Nottingham and 

Nottinghamshire Integrated Care Board (ICB) has an internal review procedure through which you can 

raise any concerns you might have. Further details of this procedure can be obtained by contacting Lucy 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.nuh.nhs.uk%2Ffreedom-of-information&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502145131%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=EoZjo8bAVU5h7D556VJgrn6DHMnGJMlFAULfhdUF0NI%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.sfh-tr.nhs.uk%2Fabout-us%2Fregulatory-information%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502166381%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=17%2Fc%2BTC2fFom5W9qgCVDFXyKnB4qwORPGaagDt%2F1Tnw%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.sfh-tr.nhs.uk%2Fabout-us%2Fregulatory-information%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502166381%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=17%2Fc%2BTC2fFom5W9qgCVDFXyKnB4qwORPGaagDt%2F1Tnw%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.dbth.nhs.uk%2Fcontact%2Ffreedom-of-information%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cnnicb-nn.foi%40nhs.net%7C16ac987351fe4664847508de6a6f13c0%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639065222502184435%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=jzLrqrxNCO7XuNrVLg2zoTXfu1%2F2GB0USj%2FGVOxdaig%3D&reserved=0


Branson, Director of Corporate Governance and Assurance via lucy.branson@nhs.net or by writing to FOI 

Team at NHS Nottingham and Nottinghamshire ICB, Sir John Robinson House, Sir John Robinson Way, 

Arnold, Daybrook, Nottingham NG5 6DA. 

If you remain dissatisfied with the outcome of the internal review, you can apply to the Information 

Commissioner’s Office (ICO), who will consider whether the organisation has complied with its obligations 

under the Act and can require the organisation to remedy any problems. Generally, the ICO cannot make 

a decision unless you have exhausted the complaints procedure provided by NHS Nottingham and 

Nottinghamshire ICB. You can find out more about how to do this, and about the Act in general, on the 

Information Commissioner’s Office website at: https://ico.org.uk/for-the-public/. 

 

Complaints to the Information Commissioner’s Office should be sent to:  

FOI/EIR Complaints Resolution, Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, 

Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF. Telephone 0303 123 1113 or report a concern via 

https://ico.org.uk/concerns/.   

 

Yours sincerely 

 

Freedom of Information (FOI) Officer on behalf of NHS Nottingham and Nottinghamshire Integrated Care 

Board  nnicb-nn.foi@nhs.net 

 

All information we have provided is subject to the provisions of the Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations 

2015. Accordingly, if the information has been made available for re-use under the Open Government Licence 

(OGL) a request to re-use is not required, but the license conditions must be met. You must not re-use any 

previously unreleased information without having the consent of NHS Nottingham and Nottinghamshire Integrated 

Care Board. Should you wish to re-use previously unreleased information then you must make your request in 

writing (email will suffice) to the FOI Lead via nnicb-nn.foi@nhs.net. All requests for re-use will be responded to 

within 20 working days of receipt. 

mailto:lucy.branson@nhs.net
https://ico.org.uk/for-the-public/
https://ico.org.uk/concerns/
mailto:Nnicb-nn.foi@nhs.net
http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/version/3/
mailto:notts.foi@nhs.net

