FOI Answers

Local Authority or ICB:
Date:

NHS Nottingham and Nott

hamsh
16th June 2023

ICB

1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the
commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements.

Name

Job title

Telelphone No.

Email Address |

Maxine Bunn

System Delivery Director

General Enquiries - NHS Nottingham and Nottinghamshire ICB

2. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the Local
Authority or ICB in residential care. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of
the vear for the financial year 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.

2022/23

2023/24

Total in residential care|

49

47

Please Note: Information provided is only for Nottingham and Nottinghamshire. This
information is not available for Bassetlaw|

3. Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the Local Authority or ICB in
residential care (q.2) please provide the number that are in ‘in area’ placements and the number
that are in ‘out of area’ placements. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of
the year for the financial year 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.

2022/23

2023/24

In area

35

33

Out of area

14

14

Please Note: Information provided is only for Nottingham and Nottinghamshire. This
information is not available for Bassetlaw|

4. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the Local
Authority or ICB in supported living. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of
the vear for the financial year 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.

2022/23

2023/24

Total in supported living

12

12

Please Note: Information provided is only for Nottingham and Nottinghamshire. This
information is not available for Bassetlaw|

5. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned from children’s
learning disabilities services into adult's services - in total, into adult residential care services
only, and into adult supported living services only. Please supply this information as a snapshot
at the end of the year for the financial year 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available
for 2023/24.

2022/23

2023/24

Total transitioned

Transitioned to residential care]

Transitioned to supported living
Nottingham and Nottinghamshire ICB do not hold this information, please contact Nottingham
City Council and Nottinghamshire County Council

6. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who ‘stepped down’ from
specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care and supported living services.
Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial year
2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.

2022/23

2023/24

Stepped down into residential care|

Stepped down into supported living
Nottingham and Nottinghamshire ICB do not hold this information, please contact Nottingham
City Council and Nottinghamshire County Council

7. Please provide the local authority or ICB's total expenditure on residential care and supported
living for adults with learning disabilities for the financial year 2022/23, and budgeted
expenditure for 2023/24.

2022/23

2023/24

Total expenditure on residential care|

Total expenditure on supported living
The total expenditure on residential care and supported living including Continuing Healthcare|
Fully Funded, Joint Funded and S117 for Nottingham and Nottinghamshire ICB|

£45.285m

Current forecast for 2023/24 (the ICB does not set budgets at specific level)

£47.956m

8. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average weekly rate paid by the Local Authority/ICB
for residential care placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years
2022/23 and 2023/24. If the Local Authority/ICB has weekly rate bands, please also provide
these.

2022/23

2023/24

The below is for Nottingham and Nottinghamshire ICB

Highest weekly rate, £|

£8.786

£8,330

Lowest weekly rate, £|

£43

£43

Average weekly rate, £|

£1,494

£1,498

Weekly rate bands, £ (if used)|

9. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average hourly rate paid by the Local Authority/ICB
for supported living placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial
years 2022/23 and 2023/24. If the Local Authority/ICB has hourly rate bands, please also
provide these.

2022/23

2023/24

Highest hourly rate, £}

Lowest hourly rate, £

Average hourly rate, £|

Hourly rate bands, £ (if used)
Nottingham and Nottinghamshire ICB do not hold this information, please contact Nottingham
City Council and Nottinghamshire County Council

This is the
ICB's
contribution to
jointly funded
care package


https://notts.icb.nhs.uk/contact-us/general-enquiries/

