

FOI Answers

ICB: **Bassetlaw**
 Date:

1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for packages of homecare for adults aged 18-65.	Name	Job title	Telephone No.	Email Address		
	Nicola Ryan	Deputy Chief Nurse, Operations and Delivery	0115 8454545	nicola.ryan4@nhs.net		
2. Please provide the number of adults in receipt of CHC funded care packages (number of care packages commenced in the year).	2016/2017	2017/2018	2018/2019	2019/2020	2020/2021	2021/22
100% CHC including FT - new packages in year only	381.0	383.0	411.0	508.0	774.0	506.0
3. Of those adults in receipt of CHC funded care packages (q.2), please provide the number that were homecare packages for adults (number of care packages commenced in the year).	2016/2017	2017/2018	2018/2019	2019/2020	2020/2021	2021/22
This information is not held as it is not separately recorded in our systems.						
4. Of those adults in receipt of CHC funded homecare packages (q.3), please provide the number that were processed through the fast track system (this is often related to end of life care packages).	2016/2017	2017/2018	2018/2019	2019/2020	2020/2021	2021/22
FT Only - new packages in year only	362.0	362.0	384.0	464.0	743.0	442.0
5. Of those adults in receipt of CHC funded care packages (q.2), please provide the number that are in receipt of personal health budgets.	2016/2017	2017/2018	2018/2019	2019/2020	2020/2021	2021/22
PHBs for all 100% CHC cases - not just new cases	8.0	14.0	22.0	65.0	51.0	81.0
6. Please provide the ICB's total gross expenditure on continuing healthcare funded packages.	2016/2017	2017/2018	2018/2019	2019/2020	2020/2021	2021/22
100% CHC inc FT - all cases EM	4.1	4.7	4.8	4.7	5.7	7.6
7. Please provide the ICB's total gross expenditure on continuing healthcare funded homecare packages.	2016/2017	2017/2018	2018/2019	2019/2020	2020/2021	2021/22
This information is not held as it is not separately recorded in our systems.						
8. Please provide the cost of the lowest, mean and highest value CHC funded homecare packages.	2016/2017	2017/2018	2018/2019	2019/2020	2020/2021	2021/22
Lowest						
Mean						
Highest						
This information is not held as it is not separately recorded in our systems.						
9. Please provide a list of the 10 providers who received the greatest amount of funding from CHC funded homecare packages.	2016/2017	2017/2018	2018/2019	2019/2020	2020/2021	2021/22
1						
2						
3						
4						
5						
6						
7						
8						
9						
10						
This information is not held as it is not separately recorded in our systems.						